




























































Sr.No. Name of Blocks/Zone Previous Auction History Reserve Price
(Rs.)

Date of Auction Bid Received
(Rs)

Remarks

1 Ord.Sand-Hattian-6 06.06.2013
20.6.2015
12.03.2016

11.4.2016 to 11.5.2016
19.7.2016
13.8.2018
20.03.202111.04.202312.06.202312.09.202303.10.202302.11.202313.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

3,81,00,000/-
14,50,000/-
Auction could
not be held due
to court orders
No Bid
7,80,00,000/-
10,03,50,000/-
48,05,00,000/-No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f.25.6.2013 to24.6.2015.Allotted w.e.f.9.7.2015 to8.7.2017.

Allotted w.e.f.5.8.2016 to 4.8.2018
Allotted w.e.f. 28.5.2019 to
27.5.2021.

Allotted w.e.f. 28.5.2021 to
27.5.2023.

52,85,50,000/-

48,05,00,000/-



2 Ord.Sand-Hattian-4
(R)

19.07.2017
12.09.2019
28.09.2021
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

16,00,00,000/-
19,40,00,000/-
50,00,00,000/-
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 28.08.2017 to
27.08.2019
Allotted w.e.f. 04.10.2019 to
03.10.2021.
Allotted w.e.f. 04.10.2021 to
03.10.2023.

52,50,00,000/-

50,00,00,000/-

3 Sand Gravel-Shahia-2
(R)

01.08.2011

23.12.2013
23.01.2014

12.03.2016

11.04.2016
11.05.2016
09.07.2016

13.08.2018

21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022

91,00,000/-

No Bid
91,00,000/-

-

No Bid
No Bid
1,00,51,000/-

3,26,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 21.01.2012 to
20.01.2014.

Allotted w.e.f. 11.02.2014 to
10.02.2016.
Auction could not be held due to
court orders.

Allotted w.e.f. 05.08.2016 to
04.08.2018.
Allotted w.e.f. 28.05.2019 to
27.05.2021.

3,75,00,000/-



01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid 3,38,43,750/-

4 Sand Gravel-Qibla
Bandi-2+3-A

26.11.2016
26.12.218 to
20.09.2021
10.11.2021
03.01.2022
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022

4,01,00,000/-

14,56,00,000/-

No Bid

-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

12,44,88,000/-



24.01.2023
11.04.2023
11.05.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

5 Sand Gravel-Mohri-1 13.08.2018

11.01.2021 to
28.04.2021

16.06.2021
03.07.2021
26.07.2021
28.09.2021

12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.5.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024

42,75,000/-

No one offered
Bid in
consecutive 04
auctions.
32,00,000/-
No Bid
No Bid
4,01,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 09.01.2019 to
08.01.2021.

Bid was not approved by LA.

Allotted w.e.f. 16.10.2021 to
15.10.2023.

4,20,05,000/-



17.08.2024 No Bid
6 Sand Gravel-Thati

Resi Nala-1
26.01.2019

16.06.2021

12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

16,50,000/-

30,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 27.05.2019 to
26.05.2021.
Allotted w.e.f. 08.09.2021 to
07.09.2023.

36,00,000/-

34,20,000/-

7 Gravel-Kalri-1 20.06.2015

19.07.2017

12.09.2019
08.10.2019

29.10.2019
30.11.2019 to
18.12.2019
02.03.2020
21.12.2020
11.01.2021
20.03.2021
07.04.2021
28.04.2021
16.06.2021
03.07.2021

3,00,000/-

26,00,000/-

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 09.07.2015 to
08.07.2017.
Allotted w.e.f. 05.08.2017 to
04.08.2019.

Auction could not be held due to
stay of High court.
-do-

27,00,000/-



26.07.2021
28.09.2021
03.01.2022
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

26,00,000/-

8 Gravel- Tura Khel
Mela-1

6.6.2013

20.6.2015 to
08.12.2015

1,50,000/-

Remained No
bid in 06
consecutive
auctions.

Allotted w.e.f. 25.6.2013 to
24.6.2015.

10,00,000/-



12.03.2016

11.04.2016
11.05.2016

09.04.2018 to
09.05.2018
06.06.2018

13.08.2018

11.01.2021
20.03.2021
07.04.2021
28.04.2021
16.06.2021
03.07.2021
26.07.2021
28.09.2021
03.01.2022
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023

-

No bid
2,00,000/-

No Bid

No one
participate in
auction.
15,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Auction could not be held due torestraining orders of the Courts.
Allotted w.e.f. 31.5.2016 to
30.5.2018.

Allotted w.e.f. 10.04.2019 to
09.04.2021 but surrender before
expiry



02.11.2023
12.12.2023
26.12.2023
08.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

10 Sand Stone-Dhok
Kahala-1

10.05.2017

13.03.2017 to
20.11.2017

20.12.2017

10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024

1,10,000/-

No bid
consecutive 7
auctions.
26,10,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 23.05.2012 to
22.05.2017.

Allotted w.e.f. 29.01.2019 to
28.01.2022.

31,50,000/-



25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

28,42,000/-

11 Sand Stone-Haveli-1 13.05.2014

12.09.2019
08.10.2019

29.10.2019
30.11.2019 to
18.12.2019
02.03.2020
21.12.2020
11.01.2021
20.03.2021
07.04.2021
28.04.2021
16.06.2021
03.07.2021
26.07.2021
28.09.2021
03.01.2022
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022

1,00,000/-

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

1st time put in auction and
allotted for five years w.e.f.
27.05.2014 to 26.05.2019.

Auction could not be held due to
stay of High court.
-do-

2,50,000/-



01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

12 Slate Stone-Romian-2 01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Newly fabricated block was put
in auction.

10,00,000/-



18.04.2024
07.05.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

9,02,500/-

Bhira-1 20.11.2017
02.03.2020
21.03.2020
13.04.2020
10.11.2021
03.01.2022
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
11.05.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024

1,55,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 21.12.2017 to
20.12.2019.

2,50,000/-



22.07.2024
17.08.2024

No Bid
No Bid

Malahi Tola -1 11.10.2010
08.12.2015
01.06.2022

16.11.2024
16.12.2024

3,80,000/-
4,30,000/-
50,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 23.11.2010 to
22.11.2015.
Allotted w.e.f. 28.12.2015 to
27.12.2020.
Allotted w.e.f. 14.06.2022 to
19.07.2024.

50,00,000/-

13 Qaziabad 4-B 12.08.2017
12.09.2019
28.07.2021
28.08.2021
24.01.2022
14.02.2022
10.05.2022
01.06.2022
21.06.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
11.05.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024

35,50,00,000/-

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 05.09.20217 to
04.09.2019.

The Said zone was divided into
two blocks Qaziabad-4 A &



18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Qaziabad-4B and accordingly
their reserve prices were fixed
amounting to Rs. 14,00,00,000/-
for each block.

14,00,00,000/-

14 Qiblabandi-4 13.05.2014
09.07.2016
13.08.2018
03.09.2018
10.10.2018
26.12.2018
26.01.2019
18.02.2019
12.09.2019
08.10.2019
29.10.2019
30.11.2019
18.12.2019
21.03.2020
02.03.2020
28.05.2020
10.05.2022
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024

4,00,00,000/-
4,19,00,000/-
No bid

No bid

No bid

9,75,00,000/-
10,76,00,000/-
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

11,83,60,000/-



16.12.2024 No bid

15 Romain -2 01.06.2022
21.06.2022
16.08.2022
13.09.2022
11.10.2022
01.12.2022
27.12.2022
24.01.2023
11.04.2023
11.05.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No Bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No Bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No Bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No Bid
No bid

9,02,500/-

16 Maira Tharti Hijri
zone

19.12.2016

26.12.2018
26.01.2019
29.10.2019
30.11.2019

31,01,00,000/-

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Allotted w.e.f. 12.01.2017 to
11.01.20219.

13,97,07,000/-



08.06.2020
11.04.2023
11.05.2023
12.06.2023
12.09.2023
03.10.2023
02.11.2023
13.12.2023
26.12.2023
18.01.2024
25.03.2024
18.04.2024
07.05.2024
25.06.2024
22.07.2024
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

17 Pormiana+jahanabad-
1

11.10.2022
2.12.2014
15.12.2015
30.07.2015
8.12.2015
11.04.2016
09.04.2018
17.08.2024
16.11.2024
16.12.2024

9,00,00,000/-
90.40,000/-
4,00.00.000/-
No Bid
No Bid
1,00,00,000/-
1,30,00,000/-
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Allotted w.e.f. 28.10.2022 to
11.01.2024. 12,60,00,000/-


