
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND KHATALA-KOT FATTU NEW ZONE DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 

The subject zone is comprising over an area of 7313.723 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Khatala and ends at village Nat District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in 

the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through main GT Road from Wazirabad road, Khatala-Chenab Railway Crossing and from main Shah Dola Road District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 50-55 Dumpers and 100-120 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

In 10 km radius of the subject zone, Although this zone is granted bid of Rs.16,00,00,000/-  and will mature its period on 04.10.2024. However, six block/zone namely (1) River Chenab Ghulam Kot Zone granted against a bid 

of Rs.14,90,00,000/- (2) Shabazpur Zone granted against a bid of Rs.11,53,00,000/- (3) Shadiwal-2 granted against a bid of Rs.5,25,000/- (4) Wazirabad River Chenab Zone-A  District Wazirabad granted against a bid of 

Rs.22,50,00,000/-(5) Kot Dina Zone District Sialkot granted against a bid of Rs. 10,76,10,000/- (6) Husainpur Randhir With its Reserve Price is Rs.4,23,15,000/-.The proposed reserve price of this block has been made as per 

previous history of the block. The reserve price is being10% enhanced in last operative bid and is proposed Rs.17,60,00,000/-. The proposed reserve price will not affect others block/s/zone fall in the radius of 10 K.M of this zone 

 

Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

Sialkot 



 

 

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ  ---------------واقع کھٹالہ کوٹ فتو زون برقبہ  7313.723  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل و  ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزرو پرائس  -/  180760000  روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 نیا زون 
آئی ۔  زون ہذا   روپے بولی 160000000/-   11.05.2022

نیلامی  امن و عامہ کی صُورت حال  کی وجہ سے مکمل نہ کی 
ضلعی نیلام کمیٹی  کی متفقہ   شفارشات    پر  بعد ازاں  ہو سکی 

جناب لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے اس زون کو آئندہ نیلامی میں شامل 
  160000000/-       کرنے  اور زون ہذا کی  نیلامی مبلغ

روپے  سے شروع کرنے کا احکامات کیئے۔ لیکن  سب سے  
زیادہ بولی دہندہ کی طرف سے دائر کردہ رویژنل اتھارٹی 

سیکرٹری مائنز اینڈ منرلز  پنجا ب  لاہور کے پاس  بولی کی  /
منظوری کی  بابت نگرانی  دائر کی۔ جو جناب رویژنل اتھارٹی 

سیکرٹری  مائنز اینڈ منرلز  پنجا ب   لاہور نے منظور فرما لی۔ /
تا     05.10.2022و  ورک آرڈر از مورخہ  کامیاب بولی دہندہ ک

جاری کر دیا گیا۔لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے  رقبہ     04.10.2024
  228تک زیر قاعدہ   03.12.2024ہذا کی معیاد میں مورخہ 

 توسیع کر دی۔ 
چیرمین ضلع نیلام کمیٹی کی عدم دستیابی        02.06.2022

 کی وجہ سے نیلام نہ ہو سکی۔

جناب سیکرٹری مائنز اینڈ منرلز پنجاب لاہور   21.06.2022
کے طرف جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی کی وجہ سے زون ہذا نیلا م  

 نہ کیا جاسکا۔ 
چیرمین ضلعی نیلام کمیٹی  کی طرف سے  امن   19.08.2024

نیلام عام ملتوی کر دینے  و عامہ کی صُورت حال کے پیش نظر  
 کی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

آئی ۔ جو  روپے بولی 180760000/-   03.09.2024
 لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی  مسترد فرما دی۔ 

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری  20.11.2024
 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 



گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ  ---------------واقع کھٹالہ کوٹ فتو زون برقبہ  7313.723  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل و  ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزرو پرائس  -/  180760000  روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 نیا زون                                                                                                    
طرف سے  ی  ک لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور06.12.2024  

    وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی کی  

طرف سے جاری  ی  کلاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور19.12.2024
    وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ کردہ حُکم امتناعی کی  

 

 
 

 

 



 
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND RIVER CHENAB GHULAM KOT ZONE DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 

The subject zone is comprising over an area of 2733.57 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Ghulam kot District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which 

replenishes during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through main GT Road from Wazirabad road, Khatala-Chenab Railway Crossing and from main Shah Dola Road District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 50-80 Dumpers and 80-100 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

The zone is granted against a bid of Rs.14,90,00,000/- w.e.f. 27.01.2023 to 26.01.2025. Bid received of Rs,18,07,60,000/- of ord,sand Khatala Kot Fattu Zone District Gujrat and Wazirabad Chenab Zone 

District Wazirabad is granted against a bid of Rs.22,50,00,000/-w.e.f 28.01.2024 to 27.01.2026. The market of Khatla Kot Fattu Zone District Gujrat,Wazirabad Chenab Zone District Wazirabad and zone in question is 

almost same i.e  Lahore,  Gujrat Cities  and its surrounding areas/villages. To rationalize the reserve price of ord.sand River Chenab Ghulam Kot Zone with the others and keeping in view of its potential and meet the 

revenue target of year 2024-2025 nearby granted zones Rs.20,00,00,000/- is being proposed. 

Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

Sialkot 

 



 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ ------------------  واقع دریائے چناب غلا کوٹ زون   برقبہ  2733.57  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل  و  ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                        

                                                                                        
موجودہ بولی                                      

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/   200000000  روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
دریائے چناب غلام کوٹ زون عام ریت کے بلاک غلام کوٹ   

جس کی ریزرو قیمت بالترتیب    3 -1اور  دریائے چناب  زون  
روپے تھی    121600000/-روپے اور  مبلغ  1300000/-مبلغ

کو ملا کر اور ریت کے ذخائر والا رقبہ شامل کر کے بنا یاگیا  
-ہے۔ سپیشل ایکسپرٹ کمیٹی نے اس کی ریزرو قیمت مبلغ 

 روپے مقرر کی ہے۔  136000000/
روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  -/149000000  25.01.2023

جاری   26.01.2025تا 27.01.2023از مورخہ  ورک آرڈر  
 تک ہے۔  26.01.2025ہ کی معیاد مورخہ قبکیا گیا۔ ر

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری کردہ   20.11.2024
 حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری   06.12.2024
 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری   19.12.2024
 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

 
 

  
 

 



 

 
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND SHAHBAZ PUR ZONE DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 

The subject zone is comprising over an area of 13856.679 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Khasa District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes 

during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through main GT Road from Jalal Pur Jattan road, District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 80-100 Dumpers and 100-150 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

The block is granted against a bid of Rs.11,53,00,000/- w.e.f. 21.01.2023 to 20.01.2025. Consumption market of the zone is Gujrat, Lahore and Sialkot city, Jalapur Jattan, Sambrial, Daska and nearby adjoining 

villages. The adjacent Kot Dina zone and Khatala Kot Fattu Zone are  granted against a bid of Rs.10,76,10,000/- w.e.f 27.05.2024 to 26.05.2026 and bid received Rs.18,07,60,000/- respectively. The Kot Dina Zone 

share the consumption market of the zone in question while the market of Khatla Kot Fattu Zone Lahore,Gujrat Cities and its surrounding areas/villages.Furthermore, a project Sialkot-Kharian Motorway has been 

lunched passing adjacent to this zone.To rationalize the reserve price of the zone in question with its potential and to meet the revenue target of year 2024-2025 Rs.15,00,00,000/- is being proposed of ord.sand Shahbaz 

Pur Zone District Gujrat 

.Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

    Sialkot 



 

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع   عام پرت نیلام     
 نیلام عام  مورخہ -------------و اقع شہباز پور زون 13856.679 ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل               و  ضلع   گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

اتھارٹی سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ    بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                       

                                                                                      
موجودہ بولی                                        

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/ 15,00,00,000روپے 

نوٹ  ۔معزز عدالت لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور نے صاحبزادہ جمیل ارشاد کی طرف سےدائر کردہ 
رٹ پٹیشن نمبری  2022/ 26029  میں  مورخہ 29.06.2022 کو جاری کردہ  حُکم  کے  

مطابق  شہباز پور زون میں پٹیشنر کی زمین جو اسُ نے اپنی پٹیشن میں ظاہر کی ہے  
سےکامیاب بولی دہندہ    پٹیشنر/ مالک زمین  )صاحبزادہ جمیل ارشاد( کی اجازت کے بغیر  

اس کی زمین سے  نکاسی معدن )ریت/گھسر( نہیں کرے گا۔ اس بابت  کامیاب بولی دہندہ کو 
 کوئی ریلیف نہیں دیا جائے گا۔  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  پٹہ کا  1800000/-  17.05.2012
   15.06.2014تا  16.06.2012مورخہ      از ورک آرڈر  

 ہوئی   دو سال معیاد پوری   جاری کیا گیا۔

روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  پٹہ کا  90000000/-  19.05.2014
   20.06.2016تا  16.06.2014مورخہ      از ورک آرڈر  

کو درخواست   07.11.2014پٹہ دار نے مورخہ   جاری کیا گیا۔
کو   07.01.2015دستبرداری پیش کر دی پٹہ کا قضہ مورخہ 

 بحق سرکار حاصل کر لیا گیا۔  
27.01.2015 ،11.03.2015   ،11.04.2015 ،                

No Bid            
13.05.2015،  25.06.2015،27.07.2015            No 

Bid         
پٹہ کا  ۔ روپے بولی منظور ہوئی 45000000/-24.08.2015 

   15.09.2017تا  16.09.2015مورخہ      از ورک آرڈر  
عدم ادائیگی قسط سوئم پٹہ  مورخہ      جاری کیا گیا۔

 منسوخ ہوا۔ 03.10.2016
16.11.2016             No Bid         
روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  پٹہ کا  30000000/-21.12.2016

  01.01.2019تا    01.02.2017مورخہ      از ورک آرڈر  
برائے عرصہ دو سال جاری کیا گیا۔ لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے پٹہ  

 دی۔    228کی معیاد میں ایک ماہ کی توسیع زیر قاعدہ 

 

 

 

 

 



    گجراتادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام

 نیلام عام  مورخہ -------------و اقع شہباز پور زون 13856.679 ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل               و  ضلع   گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 
 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 

نام بولی دہندہ                                                                       
                                                                                      

موجودہ بولی                                        

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/ 15,00,00,000  روپے 

 

شہباز پور زون کا نقشہ ترمیم کر دیا گیا اور مورخہ    -نوٹ: 
کو گورنمنٹ سے نقشہ کی    24.01.2019،   01.01.2019

 بنا پر نیلام نہ کیا گیا۔منظوری موصول نہ ہونے کی 
روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  پٹہ کا  36000000/-  23.02.2019

   30.12.2021تا  31.12.202019مورخہ      از ورک آرڈر  
لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے پٹہ کی معیاد میں چار ماہ    جاری کیا گیا۔

دی۔ پٹہ دار    228تک توسیع زیر قاعدہ   30.04.2022مورخہ 
کی  پٹہ  کی معیاد میں  مزید  توسیع کی درخواست   جناب  

لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی  نے مسترد کر دی ۔ پٹہ دار کی اپیل پر جناب  
ڈائریکٹر جنرل مائنز اینڈ منرلز پنجاب کی طرف سے   جاری  
کردہ حُکم امتناعی وجہ  سے زون ہذا کا قبضہ نہ لیا گیا۔ اور  
اپیلیٹ اتھارٹی / ڈائریکٹر جنرل مائنز اینڈ منرلز پنجاب لاہور  

توسیع کر دی۔ پٹہ دار    228نے   پٹہ کی معیاد میں زور قاعدہ  
فرم کی طرف سے پٹہ کی معیاد میں  مزید توسیع کے لیے  دی  

لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی  نے مسترد کر  گئی  درخواست  جناب 
کو   03.06.2022دی۔رقبہ کا قبضہ  بحق سرکار مورخہ 

 حاصل کر لیا گیا۔ 
زون ہذا کی نیلامی لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور کی   11.05.2022

 طرف  سے جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی کی  وجہ سے نہ ہو سکی۔  
 -----------ایضا" --------            02.06.2022
 -----------ایضا" --------            22.06.2022
 -----------ایضا" --------            22.07.2022

 

 

    گجراتادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام

 نیلام عام  مورخہ -------------و اقع شہباز پور زون 13856.679 ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل               و  ضلع   گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 



 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                       

                                                                                      
موجودہ بولی                                        

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/ 15,00,00,000  روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

زون ہذا کی نیلامی لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور کی   15.08.2022
 طرف  سے جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی کی  وجہ سے نہ ہو سکی۔  

آئی جو جنا ب   روپے بولی115300000/-  12.09.2022
لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے منظور کر لی۔  لیکن  محمد رزاق کی  

میں    2022/48278طرف سے دائر کردہ رٹ پٹیشن نمر 
لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہور کی طرف سے جاری  کردہ  حُکم  

امتناعی کےمطابق کامیاب بولی دہندہ کو ورک آرڈر جاری نہ  
کو پٹیشنر کی طرف  رٹ     19.01.2023کیا گیا۔  مورخہ 

رخہ  پٹیشن واپس لینے  کے بعد  ورک آرڈر مورخہ 
زون ہذا   جاری کیا گیا۔  تک  22.01.2025تا    21.01.2023

 تک ہے۔   22.01.2025کی معیاد مورخہ 

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری کردہ   20.11.2024
 حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی 

  یطرف سے جار  ی کورٹ لاہورک ی لاہور ہائ 06.12.2024
 ی نہ ہوئ  یلام یوجہ سے ن کی   یکردہ حُکم امتناع 

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری   19.12.2024 .
 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 



ORDINARY SAND KHADRIALA FATTEH PUR ZONE DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 

The subject zone is comprising over an area of 8056.22 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Fateh Pur District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which 

replenishes during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through main GT Road from Jalal Pur Jattan road, District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 30-50 Dumpers and 60-80 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

      The Committee after due agreed proposal deliberation, with of the Assistant Director, Sialkot and uphelé previous reserve price of Rs. 55,00,0ne/- 

 

.Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

    Sialkot 

 

 

 

 

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  



 نیلام عام  مورخہ                               واقع کھدریالہ فتح پور زون برقبہ  8056.22  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل سرائے عالمگیر ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 
 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 

نام بولی دہندہ                                                                       
                                                                                      

موجودہ بولی                                        

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  5500000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 نیا زون
No Bid         18.09.2019 

لاہور ہائی کورٹ کی طرف سے جاری کردہ حپکم   09.10.2019
 ہووسکا۔ امتناعی کے باعث نیلام عام منعقد نہ 

 -----------ایضا"--------           04.11.2019
 نیلام عام میں حصہ لینے کوئی شخص نہ آیا۔   02.12.2019

No Bid         07.03.2020 
07.03.2020         No Bid     
 لاک ڈاؤن کی وجہ سے نیلام عام منعقد نہ ہوسکا۔  28.03.2020
 ---------ایضا---------           20.04.2020
کم ہونے کی وجہ سے   روپے بولی4300000/-29.05.2020
 مسترد ہوئی ۔  

کرونا کی وجہ سے اجتماع پر پابندی تھی            12.06.2020
 نے بولی منسوخ کر دی۔  ADCRجس بنا پر 

No Bid         24.12.2020 
14.01.2021  No Bid        

ورک پٹہ کا   روپے بولی منظور ہوئی4410000/-04.02.2021 
جاری کیا   02.03.2023تا   03.03.2021   ورخہم  از آرڈر 

 ہوئی۔   دو سال معیاد پوری  گیا۔
 No Bid           10.04.2023 

10.05.2023           No Bid 

10.06.2023No bid          

13.09.2023No bid          

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ                               واقع کھدریالہ فتح پور زون برقبہ  8056.22  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل سرائے عالمگیر ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

کیفیت بلاک نیلام سابقہ  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی   



نام بولی دہندہ                                                                       
                                                                                      

موجودہ بولی                                        

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  5500000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

05.10.2023   No Bid 

04.11.2023            No Bid 

15.12.2023           No  Bid 

28.12.2023           No  Bid 

16.01.2024            No Bid 

29.03.2024            No Bid 

20.04.2024          No Bid 

09.05.2024          No Bid 

26.06.2024          No Bid 

24.07.2024            No Bid 

چیرمین ضلعی نیلام کمیٹی  کی طرف سے  امن  19.08.2024
نیلام عام  و عامہ کی  صُورت حال خراب ہونے  کے پیش نظر   

 ملتوی کر دیا جس وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری کردہ   20.11.2024
 حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

کردہ   یطرف سے جار یکورٹ لاہورک یلاہور ہائ06.12.2024
 ۔ ینہ ہوئ یلامی وجہ سے ن  ی یحُکم امتناع

19.12.2024             No Bid 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 



of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND MANGO WAL SHIRQI  DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 

The subject zone is comprising over an area of 498.25 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3.. This sand zone is located Mango Wal Sharqi District Gujrat.   

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through main GT Road from Tanda Road, District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 20-40 Dumpers and 40-60 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

Only one zone  namely Shahbaz Pur Zone is granted against a bid of Rs.11,53,00000/- for two years w.e.f 21.01.2023 to 20.01.2025  in the radius of 10 KM of the proposed block. Being low quality of sand/bhassar 

deposits, the consumption market of block  is nearby Jalapur Jattan, Mangowal and surrounding villages & Towns while the consumption market of the ShahbazPur zone is Gujrat and Sialkot cities and its 

surrounding villages and towns being good quality of sand /ghassar of river Chenab. 

This newly created block is fall in lands and no river or Nullahs lies in this block.  

The reserve price of ord.sand  new block Mangowal Sherqi is being proposed of Rs.50,00,000/- to attract the bidders.It is also hoped that in coming auction this block will fetched the bid. Furthermore, it is  added 

here that this block price will not effect the market of Shahbaz Pur ZoneOnly one zone  namely Shahbaz Pur Zone is granted against a bid of Rs.11,53,00000/- for two years w.e.f 21.01.2023 to 20.01.2025  in the 

radius of 10 KM of the proposed block. Being low quality of sand/bhassar deposits, the consumption market of block  is nearby Jalapur Jattan, Mangowal and surrounding villages & Towns while the consumption 

market of the ShahbazPur zone is Gujrat and Sialkot cities and its surrounding villages and towns being good quality of sand /ghassar of river Chenab. 

This newly created block is fall in lands and no river or Nullahs lies in this block.  

The reserve price of ord.sand  new block Mangowal Sherqi is being proposed of Rs.50,00,000/- to attract the bidders.It is also hoped that in coming auction this block will fetched the bid. Furthermore, it is  added 

here that this block price will not effect the market of Shahbaz Pur Zone./- 



 

.Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

    Sialkot 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ                                     واقع منگوال شرقی)نیا بلاک( برقبہ  498.25  ایکڑز ریت/بھسرتحصیل جلالپور ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی سفارشات و   بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         

 کیفیت 



موجودہ بولی                                 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  5000000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 نیا بلاک 
لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری  20.11.2024

 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 
لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے   06.12.2024

 جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔

19.12.2024            No Bid 

 

  
 

 

 
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND SURKH PUR ZONE DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 



The subject zone is comprising over an area of 482.87 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Surkh Pur District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which 

replenishes during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through Head Marala Road District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 30-55 Dumpers and 60-80 trollies per day except rainy season.  

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

Previously this block was granted against a bid of Rs.6,05,00,000/- w.e.f 02.10.2018 to 01.10.2020.During its previous tenure, the said block  was granted 431.301 acres, however an area 

measuring  to 385.301 was withdrawn by the Licensing Authority on the request  of Pak Army for defense purpose. The total bid money of the block was accordingly reduced to the tune of 

Rs.1.92.59.379/-. The area of the said block was revised upto 482.87 acres by adding nearby potential mineral bearing area. The reserve price of the block was estimated amounting to  

Rs.3,00,00,000/-. After fixed the reserve price amounting to Rs.3,00,00,000/-, the block was granted against a bid of Rs.4,03,70,000/- w.e.f 18.04.2024 to 17.04.2026 but lease cancelled due to non-

payment of 2nd installment.  Because the tenure of the lease period  could not be completed so the reserve price of the block is being proposed amounting to Rs.3,00,00,000/- 

Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

Sialkot 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ                                    واقع سُرخ پوربرقبہ  482.87  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل و ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                        

                                                                                        
زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           



موجودہ بولی                                      

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/   27000000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

    روپے بولی منظور ہوئی500000/ -         17.12.2012
تا   23.06.2012ورخہم   از  ورک آرڈر پٹہ کا  

   ہوئی۔   دو سال معیاد پوری  جاری کیا گیا۔   22.06.2012
    

پٹہ      روپے بولی منظور ہوئی2525000/-  19.05.2014
   22.03.2016تا  23.06.2014ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر  کا 

عدم ادائیگی قسط چہارم کی بنا پر پٹہ ہذا    -جاری کیا گیا
 منسوخ ہو۔ ۔  30.01.2016مورخہ  کو   

پٹہ      روپے بولی منظور ہوئی5510000/-  20.04.2016
تا    28.04.2016    ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر  کا 

رقبہ کا قبضہ مورخہ   جاری کیا گیا۔27.04.2018
 کو بحق سرکار حاصل کیا  گیا۔  05.05.2018
عدالت دیوانی گجرات کی جانب سے جاری   20.04.2018

 کردہ حکم امتناعی کی بنا پر  بلاک ہذاا نیلام نہ کیا گیا۔
روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  60500000 / -  14.05.2018

تا       02.10.2018     ورخہم  از  ورک آرڈر  
پاک آرمی  نے نڈالہ پلُ کے     جاری کیا گیا۔ 01.10.2020

میٹر تک الاٹ شُدہ رقبہ سے     1000کے دونوں اطراف 
نکاسی معدن کرنے پر پابندی لگا  دی ۔ جس کی وجہ سے   

لائسنسنگ     ایکڑز میں سے       431.301الاٹ شُدہ رقبہ 
 اتھارٹی  نے   

مفادعامہ کی خاطر   217ایکڑز  رقبہ زیر قاعدہ  358.221
 نکال دیا۔اور  اسی تناسب سے

 

  
گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  

 نیلام عام  مورخہ                                    واقع سُرخ پوربرقبہ  482.87  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل و ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 
 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 

نام بولی دہندہ                                                                        
                                                                                        

موجودہ بولی                                      

زرنیلام                          کیفیت              تاریخ نیلام           



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/   27000000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

سابقہ پٹہ دار کو بولی کی رقم جناب  لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی   نے  
  / -بولی کی رقم  مبلغ            واپس کر دی۔ اور 

روپے کر دی    19259379/-روپے سے    60500000
مورخہ   228گئی۔ پٹہ کی معیاد  بشمول زیر قاعدہ 

کو رقبہ   01.03.2021تک رہی اور مورخہ  28.02.2021
کا قبضہ  بحق سرکار حاصل کر لیا گیا۔  بعد ازاں  رقبہ کو  

 جناب لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی کی منظوری  سے ترمیم کر دیا گیا ۔ 
10.04.2023             No Bid               

10.05.2023              No Bid 

10.06.2023 No Bid               

13.09.2023No bid                     
05.10.2023              No Bid 
04.11.2023              No Bid 
15.12.2023              No Bid 
28.12.2023           No  Bid     
16.01.2024               No Bid 

 

 
 

 

 

 

Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

ORDINARY SAND AWAN SHARIF DISTRICT GUJRAT 

• Geological Survey, Location and Assessment of Mineral in the Block: 



The subject zone is comprising over an area of 494.26 acres falls on Survey of Pakistan Topo Sheet No.43-L/2 and 43-L/3. The area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab and its starts in the 

upstream of GT Road near village Awan Sharif District Gujrat. As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which 

replenishes during rainy seasons. Good quality sand deposits are available in the area to meet the market/requirement of Gujrat city & adjacent villages and towns. 

• Quality of Mineral in the Block: 

As most of the area of zone is located on the riverbeds of River Chenab therefore good quality sand deposits are abundant in the area which replenishes during rainy seasons. 

• Availability of Access Road to the Block: 

The area of the zone can be accessed through Awan Sharif road and Kotla Arab Ali Road District Gujrat.  

• Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral in the Block:  

The consumption market is to meet the requirement of adjacent villages and towns for filling purposes, construction and for making bricks.   

• Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Block During Last 5 years: 

New block in auction 

• Previous Bidding History of the Block:  

Attached as Annex-I. 

• Future Potential for Excavation from the Block:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of ±10%. 

• Any Unique Factor at the Site of Block Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

There is no block/zone of sand/Gravel fall in the radius of this block. The reserve price of this new block (Awan Sharif) is being proposed  Rs.50,00,000/- to attract the  bidders. It is also hoped that in coming auction 

this block will fetched the bid. 

 

 

Assistant Director Mines and Minerals 

Sialkot 

 

 

 

گجرات ادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ   19.12.2024   واقع اعوان شریف )نیا بلاک( برقبہ 494.26  ایکڑز ریت/گریول ضلع گجرات برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         

 کیفیت 



موجودہ بولی                                 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  5000000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 نیا بلاک 
لاہور ہائی کورٹ لاہورکی طرف سے جاری  20.11.2024

 کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 
لاہورکی طرف سے  لاہور ہائی کورٹ   06.12.2024

 جاری کردہ حُکم امتناعی ی وجہ سے نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

19.12.2024      No Bid 

 

 ـــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــــ   
 

 

 

 

 


