
PROFILE OF ORIDNARY SAND CHAK NO. 67/15 L / WAJIHAN WALA ZONE-1 

DISTRICT KHANEWAL 

a) Geological Survey, Location of zone and assessment of mineral in the block: 

The mining lease of ordinary sand Chak No.67/15-L / WajhianWala Zone-1over an area of 

7262.89 acres is located in the eastern side of Sindhni Mailsi Link Cannal & on the boundary 

of Vehari-Khanewal in District Khanewal. It falls on the Survey of Pakistan topo sheet 44B/4& 

44B/8. Geologically the area of the zone falls in the old bed of Sutluj river as well as in 

agriculture lands. Fluvial type of sand deposits are present. Sand is not exposed on surface and 

is being excavated by removing over burden i.e. upper soil surface of 3-5 feet and pit of sand 

can be established with the consent of landowner.   

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

Medium to good quality sand deposit are available in the zone area and mostly used for 

construction purpose.  

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

The area of Zone is accessible from Katcha khoh to Vehari road. The existing pit is 

approachable through 2 km from Katcha Khoh to Vehari metal road near Wajhian wala town. 

Furthermore sand can also be supplied to the Katcha Khoo town. 

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

The main consumption market of this block is Wajhianwala town and its surrounding villages 

which are easily accessible from the pit of sand in leased area. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the zone during last five years: 

No production data of sand is available, however, as per observation during site visits average 

excavation of sand/ghassar is ranging from 10-12 trollies per day depending upon demand.  

f) Previous bidding history of the block: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new development project is reported to be constructed in the vicinity of the block, therefore, 

potential is expected to be same with an average change of ±10% 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

Nil  



PROFILE OF ORDINARY SAND BASTI DULWAN ZONE, DISTRICT KHANEWAL 

a) Geological Survey, Location of zone and assessment of mineral in the zone: 

Mining lease for ordinary sand BastiDulwan over an area of 13306 acres is located in the north 

of Mianchannu city at distance of about 20km from Mianchannu city. Most of the area of the 

zone falls in bed of River Ravi. Geologically, this zone has fluvial deposits of sand/ ghassar 

which are replenished each year during flood. It falls on Topo sheet 44B/6. 

b) Quality of mineral in the zone: 

Medium to good quality sand/gassar is available in the zone. 

c) Availability of access road to the zone: 

A metalled road about 20 km from Mian Channu leads to Dulwan Basti from where about 2 

km kacha road is required to be maintain to approach the sand deposits in the river bed.  

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the zone: 

Main consumption markets of this zone are Tulamba and Mian Channu city which are 

accessible from the pits of the sand in the lease area. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the zone during last five years: 

No production data of sand is available, however, reportedly, an average excavation of sand is 

ranging from 25-30 trollies per day depending on demand. 

f) Previous bidding history of the zone: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the zone: 

No new project is reported to be constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be 

same with an average change of ±10% 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

Nil  

  



BIDDING HISTORY OF ORD. SAND BASTI DULWAN ZONE DISTRICT KHANEWAL 

 

Auction date 
Bid Received 

(Rs) 

Order of 

Licensing 

Authority 

 Status/ Remarks 

21.04.2016 75,00,000/- App  

Bid accepted. W/o issued for two 

years from 28.05.2016 to 

27.05.2018. Lessee has paid all 

the installments.    

14.04.2018 1,70,11,000/- App 

Work order issued for two years 

w.e.f. 11.02.2019 to 10.02.2021 

but cancelled due to non-

payment of 3rd installment and 

possession was taken on 

27.02.2020. 

13.01.2021 No Bid - - 

03.02.2021 No Bid - - 

22.03.2021 1,50,01,000/- App 

Work order issued for two years 

w.e.f. 15.04.2021 to 14.04.2023. 

Lessee has paid all the 

installments. 

15.04.2023 

16.05.2023 

17.06.2023 

No Bid - - 

12.09.2023 

05.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

No Bid - - 

13.12.2023 

26.12.2023 

15.01.2024 

No Bid - - 

25.03.2024 

17.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

No Bid - - 

26.06.2024 

22.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

No Bid - - 

22.11.2024 

05.12.2024 

18.12.2024 

No Bid - - 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



BIDDING HISTORY OF ORD. SAND CHAK NO. 67/15-L/WAJHIAN WALA ZONE-1 

DISTRICT KHANEWAL 

 

Auction date 
Bid Received 

(Rs) 

Order of 

Licensing 

Authority 

 Status/ Remarks 

First time auctioned after merging block i.e. ordinary sand Chak No. 67/15-L block granted against 

bid of Rs.48,11,000/- for two years w.e.f 26.09.2018 to 25.09.2020. Extension granted under rule 

228 of Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 w.e.f 26.02.2021 to 25.03.2021 @ new reserve 

price Rs. 80,00,000/- 

22.03.2021 1,50,02,000/- App 

Work order issued for two years 

06.04.2021 to 05.04.2023. Full 

lease period 

15.04.2023 No Bid - - 

16.05.2023 No Bid - - 

17.06.2023 No Bid - - 

12.09.2023 No Bid - - 

05.10.2023 No Bid - - 

04.11.2023 No Bid - - 

13.12.2023 No Bid - - 

26.12.2023 No Bid - - 

15.01.2024 No Bid - - 

25.03.2024 No Bid - - 

17.04.2024 No Bid - - 

07.05.2024 No Bid - - 

26.06.2024 No Bid - - 

22.07.2024 No Bid - - 

17.08.2024 No Bid - - 

22.11.2024 No Bid - - 

05.12.2024 No Bid - - 

18.12.2024 No Bid - - 

 



 

 

 


