
Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Ord. Sand/Ghassar Ghazi Ghat/Chowk Qureshi, District Muzaffargarh 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of zone and assessment of mineral in the zone: 

This newly proposed zone is located on main Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road near Basira Village 

covering sand dunes along the road in this area and fall on topo sheet No.39, N/4 of Survey of 

Pakistan. Geologically these areas were, in the historic time, part of indus river as a result of which a 

number of sand dunes covering thousands acres are available. .  

b) Quality of mineral in the zone: 

This zone contains ghassar deposits in the form of sand dunes which can be used for filling purpose 

for under construction Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road. 

c) Availability of access road to the zone: 

The main Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road passes through this zone & sand dunes are located on both 

sides of road. 

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the zone: 

The objective for creation of this zone is supply of filling material required for under construction 

Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the zone during last five years: 

This is a newly created zone. 

f) Previous bidding history of the zone: 

It is a newly created zone. 

g) Future potential for excavation from the zone: 

Future potential of this zone is use of ghassar as filling material in the under construction 

Muzzaffargar-DG Khan road. 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

Nil 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Previous Bidding History of Ordinary Sand Ghazi Ghat Chowk Qureshi Zone 

District Muzaffargarh 
 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

مورخہ   آرڈر  ورک  ہوئی۔  منظور  بولی 
سے جاری ہوا۔ رقبہ کی میعاد پوری    16.12.2016

مورخہ   پر  بحق    16.12.2018ہونے  کوقبضہ 
 سرکار حاصل کیا گیا۔ 

30,00,000 30.11.2016 

- No Bid 01.01.2019 

26.01.2019 

23.02.2019 

13.09.2019 

01.10.2019 

05.11.2019 

02.12.2019 

21.12.2019 

05.03.2020 

بوجہ کرونا وائرس، کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ 
 کی۔  

- 26.03.2020 

17.04.2020 

29.05.2020 
12.06.2020 

- No Bid 

03.10.2020 

24.10.2020 

14.11.2020 

 23.12.2020  کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ کی۔  

- 
No Bid 

13.01.2021 

 03.02.2021 

مورخہ   آرڈر  ورک  ہوئی۔  منظور  بولی 
سے جاری ہوا۔ رقبہ کی میعاد پوری    17.07.2021

مورخہ   پر  بحق    12.08.2022ہونے  کوقبضہ 
 سرکار حاصل کیا گیا۔ 

20,25,000 22.03.2021 

 No Bid 10.04.2021 

 03.05.2021 

 19.06.2021 

 No Bid 05.12.2022 

 31.12.2022  کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ کی۔  

 28.01.2023 

 No Bid 15.04.2023 

 16.05.2023  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

17.06.2023 

بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین ضلعی نیلام کمیٹی نیلامی  
 نہ ہوئی۔ 

 12.09.2023 

 No Bid 07.10.2023 

06.11.2023 

 26.12.2023  کسی نے نیلامی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

16.01.2024 

 No Bid 29.03.2024 

 23.04.2024  کسی نے رجسٹریشن نہ کرائی۔  

 No Bid 09.05.2024 

26.06.2024 

24.07.2024 



15.08.2024 

21.11.2024 

07.12.2024 

 19.12.2024  کسی نے رجسٹریشن نہ کرائی۔  

 
ASSISTANT DIRECTOR MINES & MINERALS 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 



 

Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Ord. Sand/Ghassar Basira Zone-1 (NEW ZONE), District Muzaffargarh 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of zone and assessment of mineral in the zone: 

This newly proposed zone is located on main Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road near Basira Village 

covering sand dunes along the road in this area and fall on topo sheet No.39, N/4 of Survey of 

Pakistan. Geologically these areas were, in the historic time, part of indus river as a result of which a 

number of sand dunes covering thousands acres are available. .  

b) Quality of mineral in the zone: 

This zone contains ghassar deposits in the form of sand dunes which can be used for filling purpose 

for under construction Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road. 

c) Availability of access road to the zone: 

The main Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road passes through this zone & sand dunes are located on both 

sides of road. 

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the zone: 

The objective for creation of this zone is supply of filling material required for under construction 

Muzaffargarh – D.G.Khan Road. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the zone during last five years: 

This is a newly created zone. 

f) Previous bidding history of the zone: 

It is a newly created zone. 

g) Future potential for excavation from the zone: 

Future potential of this zone is use of ghassar as filling material in the under construction 

Muzzaffargar-DG Khan road. 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

Nil 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

  



Annex-A 

 

Previous Bidding History of Ord. Sand Basira Zone-1 

District Muzaffargarh 
 تاریخ نیلام  زر نیلام  کیفیت 

 No Bid 05.03.2020 

بوجہ کرونا وائرس، کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ 
 کی۔  

- 26.03.2020 

17.04.2020 

29.05.2020 
12.06.2020 

- No Bid 

03.10.2020 

24.10.2020 

14.11.2020 

 23.12.2020  کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ کی۔  

- No Bid 

13.01.2021 

03.02.2021 

22.03.2021 

10.04.2021 

03.05.2021 

19.06.2021 

07.07.2021 

 31.07.2021  کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ کی۔  

- 

No Bid 

02.10.2021 

26.10.2021 

16.11.2021 

05.01.2022 

 26.01.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 16.02.2022 

14.05.2022 

04.06.2022 

25.06.2022 

 22.08.2022  بوجہ حکم امتناعی حکومت پنجاب بولی نہ ہوئی۔  

 No Bid 21.09.2022 

 15.10.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 05.12.2022 

 31.12.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

  28.01.2023 

 No Bid 15.04.2023 

 16.05.2023  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

17.06.2023 

بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین ضلعی نیلام 
 نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ کمیٹی 

 12.09.2023 

 No Bid 07.10.2023 

06.11.2023 

13.12.2023 

 26.12.2023 - کسی نے نیلامی میں شرکت نہ کی

16.01.2024 

 No Bid 29.03.2024 

 23.04.2024  کسی نے رجسٹریشن نہ کرائی۔  



 No Bid 09.05.2024 

26.06.2024 

24.07.2024 

15.08.2024 

21.11.2024 

07.12.2024 

 19.12.2024  کسی نے رجسٹریشن نہ کرائی۔  

 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

 


