
 

Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Reserve Price of Sand/Gravel Berot Nala Zone, District Rajanpur 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of block and assessment of mineral in the block: 

Sand/Gravel Berot Nala Zone over an area of 41888.66 acres falls on Topo sheet 39 G/16. The zone 

contains mineral deposits (formed as a result of weathering and erosion of rocks by hill torrents 

flowing downstream from hill sides of Koh Suleman Range) of inter mixed sand and gravel/boulders 

that are replenished by hill torrents. A metallic road (about 18km) from Rajanpur City goes to Farid 

Air Base from where and a kacha road about 14 km via BMP Post Kot Sabzal. From this post a kacha 

road about 12 km long in Pitokh Nala towards north leads Belab Nala where zone is situated. The 

mineral available is sufficient to meet the quantum of future excavation. It is located on eastern side 

of Koh Suleman range.  

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

The mineral present in the zone ranges from medium sand to coarse sand and gravel to boulders.  

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

A metallic road (about 18km) from Rajanpur City goes to Farid Air Base from where and a kacha 

road about 14 km via BMP Post Kot Sabzal. From this post a kacha road about 12 long in Pitokh Nala 

towards north leads Belab Nala where zone is situated. 

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

There is no consumption market of the mineral from this zone. However, it was used in the 

development projects of irrigation department.  

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the block during last five years: 

New Zone 

f) Previous bidding history of the block 

Previous Bidding History of the block is attached as Annex-A 

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new project is reported to constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be same with 

an average change ±5%.  

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

Nil 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 
 

  



Previous Bidding History of Sand-Gravel Berot Nala Zone 

District Rajanpur 
 

 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

 No Bid 

 

13.09.2023 

04.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

15.12.2023 

 28.12.2023 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

15.01.2024 

 No Bid 27.03.2024 

18.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

27.06.2024 

20.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

19.11.2024 
04.12.2024 

18.12.2024 

 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 
 



Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

RESERVE PRICE OF ORDINARY SAND POST BARA ZONE 

OVER AN AREA OF 79654.03 ACRES, DISTRICT RAJANPUR 

 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of block and assessment of mineral in the block: 

Mining lease of ordinary sand over an area of 79654.03 acres is located near bara in district Rajanpur. 

It falls about 28 km away from Kashmor on Kashmor to sui road. Geologically, block contains 

deposits mainly consisting of gravel/boulder, formed as a result of weathering and erosion of rocks by 

hill torrents flowing downstream from hill sides of Koh Suleman Range. It is situated on eastern side 

of koh Suleman Range. As per field observations from the old/current working pits, workable seam of 

gravel is about 10 feet in the leased area which is sufficient for future excavation. It falls on Topo 

sheet 39 H/6 

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

The mineral size in the block ranges from gravel to boulder which is suitable for crushing plants and 

development work of irrigation department. 

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

A metal road about 28 km from Kashmor to Sui (Balochistan) passes nearby the block.  

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

The major markets are crusher plants installed in the vicinity of railway crossing, Kashmor.  

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the block during last five years: 

No production data of gravel of any zone is available however reportedly an average excavation of 

gravel is ranging from 3-4 trolleys per day as per demand. 

f) Previous bidding history of the block: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new project is reported to constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be same with 

an average change ±5%.  

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

NIL  

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

 

 

 



Previous Bidding History of Ordinary Sand Post Bara Zone 

District Rajanpur 
 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

مورخہ   آرڈر  ورک  ہوئی۔  منظور  بولی 
 سے جاری ہوا۔  16.12.2016

اور    ہوا  منسوخ  قسط  دوسری  ادائیگی  عدم  پٹہ 
حاصل    27.06.2018مورخہ سرکار  بحق  کوقبضہ 
 کیا گیا۔ 

16,00,00,000 28.11.2016 

- No Bid 

15.08.2018 

05.09.2018 

04.10.2018 

29.12.2018 

23.01.2019 

20.02.2019 

16.09.2019 

 07.10.2019  بوجہ حکم امتناعی لاہور ہائی کورٹ نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

  28.10.2019 
 30.11.2019  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

- No Bid 18.12.2019 

02.03.2020 

21.03.2020 

 13.04.2020  بوجہ لاک ڈاؤن نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 22.05.2020  بوجہ سرکاری تعطیلات  نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  
 28.05.2020  کسی نے نیلامی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 08.06.2020 

- No Bid 28.09.2020 

17.10.2020 

07.11.2020 

19.12.2020 

- No Bid 09.01.2021 

28.01.2021 

20.03.2021 

 07.04.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  
 No Bid 28.04.2021 

17.06.2021 

 05.07.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 28.07.2021 

 No Bid 29.09.2021 

 23.10.2021  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  
 13.11.2021  مقامی چھٹی کی وجہ سے بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 03.01.2022 

 24.01.2022 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 14.02.2022 

 No Bid 11.05.2022 

 02.06.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

 22.06.2022 

 20.08.2022  بوجہ حکم امتناعی حکومت پنجاب بولی نہ ہوئی۔  

 19.09.2022  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  
 No Bid 17.10.2022 

 03.12.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 28.12.2022 

 25.01.2023 

 12.04.2023  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 No Bid 13.05.2023 

13.06.2023 

13.09.2023 

04.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

15.12.2023 
 28.12.2023 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

15.01.2024 

 No Bid 27.03.2024 

18.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

27.06.2024 



20.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

19.11.2024 

04.12.2024 

18.12.2024 

 

 
 

 

ASSISTANT DIRECTOR MINES & MINERALS 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 



Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Gravel Block Shori Nala-2, District Rajanpur 

 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of block and assessment of mineral in the block: 

Mining lease of Gravel block Shori Nala-2 is located near Shori in district Rajanpur. A kacha road 

about 9 km from railway crossing near Shah Wali (situated on Rajanpur-Kashmoor road) and 4 km 

kacha road ahead in Shori Nala leads to the block. Geologically, block contains deposits of gravel 

formed as a result of weathering and erosion of rocks by hill torrents flowing downstream from hill 

sides of Koh Suleman Range. It is situated on eastern side of koh Suleman Range. As per field 

observations from the old/current working pits, workable seam of gravel is about 12 feet in the leased 

area which is sufficient for future excavation. It falls on survey of Pakistan topo sheet 39 H/10 

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

The mineral size in the block ranges from gravel to boulders which is suitable for crushing plants and 

development work of irrigation department 

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

A kacha road about 9 km from railway crossing near Shah Wali and 4 km kacha road ahead in Shori 

Nala leads to the block.  

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

The major markets are Crushers installed near Kashmor Railway Crossing on Sui road, Kashmor city 

and Guddu Barrage. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the block during last five years: 

No production data of gravel of any zone is available however reportedly an average excavation of 

gravel is ranging from 15-20 trolleys per day as per demand. 

f) Previous bidding history of the block: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new project is reported to constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be same with 

an average change ±5%. 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

A unique factor of 800% is applied to the base price to balance the reserve price of nearby granted 

blocks/zones. 

 

ASSISTANT DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

  



 

 

Previous Bidding History of Gravel Shori Nala-2, 

District Rajanpur 
 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

 29.12.2018 46,00,000 بولی نامنظور ہوئی۔  

مورخہ  آرڈر  ورک  ہوئی۔  منظور  بولی 
سے جاری ہوا۔ رقبہ کی میعاد پوری    20.05.2019

مورخہ   پر  بحق    20.05.2021ہونے  کوقبضہ 
 سرکار حاصل کیا گیا۔ 

47,50,000 23.01.2019 

 No Bid 20.03.2021 

 07.04.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  
 28.04.2021 

 No Bid 17.06.2021 

 05.07.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 28.07.2021 

 No Bid 29.09.2021 

 23.10.2021  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  
 13.11.2021  مقامی چھٹی کی وجہ سے بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 03.01.2022 

 24.01.2022 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

14.02.2022 

 No Bid 11.05.2022 

 02.06.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

 22.06.2022 

 20.08.2022  بوجہ حکم امتناعی حکومت پنجاب بولی نہ ہوئی۔  

 19.09.2022  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  
 No Bid 17.10.2022 

 03.12.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 28.12.2022 

  25.01.2023 
 12.04.2023  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 No Bid 13.05.2023 

13.06.2023 

13.09.2023 

04.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

15.12.2023 
 28.12.2023 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

15.01.2024 

 No Bid 27.03.2024 

18.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

27.06.2024 

20.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

19.11.2024 

04.12.2024 

18.12.2024 

 

 

 



Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Gravel Block Shori Nala-3, District Rajanpur 

 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of block and assessment of mineral in the block: 

Mining lease of Gravel block Shori Nala-3 over an area of 499.15 acres is located near Shori in 

district Rajanpur. A kacha road about 9 km from railway crossing near Shah Wali (situated on 

Rajanpur-Kashmoor road) and 4 km kacha road ahead in Shori Nala leads to the block. Geologically, 

block contains deposits of gravel formed as a result of weathering and erosion of rocks by hill torrents 

flowing downstream from hill sides of Koh Suleman Range. It is situated on eastern side of koh 

Suleman Range. As per field observations from the old/current working pits, workable seam of gravel 

is about 12 feet in the leased area which is sufficient for future excavation. It falls on survey of 

Pakistan topo sheet 39 H/10 

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

The mineral size in the block ranges from gravel to boulders which is suitable for crushing plants and 

development work of irrigation department 

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

A kacha road about 9 km from railway crossing near Shah Wali and 4 km kacha road ahead in Shori 

Nala leads to the block.  

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

The major markets are Crushers installed near Kashmor Railway Crossing on Sui road, Kashmor city 

and Guddu Barrage. 

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the block during last five years: 

No production data of gravel of any zone is available however reportedly an average excavation of 

gravel is ranging from 15-20 trolleys per day as per demand. 

f) Previous bidding history of the block: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new project is reported to constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be same with 

an average change ±5%. 

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

A unique factor of 800% is applied to the base price to balance the reserve price of nearby granted 

blocks/zones. 

 

ASSISTANT DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

  



 

 

Previous Bidding History of Gravel Shori Nala-3, 

District Rajanpur 
 

 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

 07.10.2019  بوجہ حکم امتناعی لاہور ہائی کورٹ نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 28.10.2019 
 30.11.2019  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

- No Bid 18.12.2019 

02.03.2020 

21.03.2020 

 13.04.2020  بوجہ لاک ڈاؤن نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 22.05.2020  بوجہ سرکاری تعطیلات  نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  
 28.05.2020  کسی نے نیلامی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 08.06.2020 

- 

No Bid 28.09.2020 

17.10.2020 

07.11.2020 

19.12.2020 

- No Bid 09.01.2021 

 No Bid 28.01.2021 

20.03.2021 

 07.04.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 No Bid 
28.04.2021 

17.06.2021 

 05.07.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 28.07.2021 

 No Bid 29.09.2021 

 23.10.2021  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  
 13.11.2021  مقامی چھٹی کی وجہ سے بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 03.01.2022 
 24.01.2022 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

  14.02.2022 

 No Bid 11.05.2022 

 02.06.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

  22.06.2022 

 20.08.2022  بوجہ حکم امتناعی حکومت پنجاب بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 19.09.2022  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 17.10.2022 

 03.12.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 28.12.2022 

  25.01.2023 
 12.04.2023  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 13.05.2023 

13.06.2023 

13.09.2023 

04.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

15.12.2023 
 28.12.2023 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔

15.01.2024 

 No Bid 27.03.2024 

18.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

27.06.2024 

20.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

19.11.2024 

04.12.2024 

18.12.2024 



 

 

 



Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) of the  

Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 

 

Gravel Block Sui Road Bara-3, District Rajanpur 

 

a) Geological Survey, Location of block and assessment of mineral in the block: 

Mining lease of gravel block Sui Road Bara-3 over an area of 88.95 acres is located near Bara in 

district Rajanpur. It falls about 28 km away from Kashmor on Kashmor to sui road. Geologically, 

block contains deposits mainly consisting of gravel/boulder, formed as a result of weathering and 

erosion of rocks by hill torrents flowing downstream from hill sides of Koh Suleman Range. It is 

situated on eastern side of koh Suleman Range. As per field observations from the old/current 

working pits, workable seam of gravel is about 10 feet in the leased area which is sufficient for future 

excavation. It falls on Topo sheet 39 H/6 

b) Quality of mineral in the block: 

The mineral size in the block ranges from gravel to boulder which is suitable for crushing plants and 

development work of irrigation department. 

c) Availability of access road to the block: 

A metal road about 28 km from Kashmor to Sui (Balochistan) passes nearby the block.  

d) Accessibility to the market and consumption of the mineral in the block: 

The major markets are crusher plants installed in the vicinity of railway crossing, Kashmor.  

e) Average excavated quantity of mineral from the block during last five years: 

No production data of gravel of any zone is available however reportedly an average excavation of 

gravel is ranging from 3-4 trolleys per day as per demand. 

f) Previous bidding history of the block: 

Attached  

g) Future potential for excavation from the block: 

No new project is reported to constructed in this area, therefore, potential is expected to be same with 

an average change ±5%.  

h) Any unique factor at site to consider the reserved price: 

NIL  

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

 

 

  



 

Annex-A 

Previous Bidding History of Gravel Sui Road Bara-3, 

District Rajanpur 
 تاریخ نیلام زر نیلام کیفیت 

 07.10.2019  بوجہ حکم امتناعی لاہور ہائی کورٹ نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 28.10.2019 
 30.11.2019  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

- No Bid 18.12.2019 

02.03.2020 

21.03.2020 

 13.04.2020  بوجہ لاک ڈاؤن نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  

 22.05.2020  بوجہ سرکاری تعطیلات  نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔  
 28.05.2020  کسی نے نیلامی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 08.06.2020 

- 

No Bid 28.09.2020 

17.10.2020 

07.11.2020 

19.12.2020 

- No Bid 09.01.2021 

 No Bid 28.01.2021 

20.03.2021 

 07.04.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 No Bid 
28.04.2021 

17.06.2021 

 05.07.2021  کسی نے بولی میں حصہ نہ لیا۔  

 28.07.2021 

 No Bid 29.09.2021 

 23.10.2021  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  
 13.11.2021  مقامی چھٹی کی وجہ سے بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 03.01.2022 
 24.01.2022 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

  14.02.2022 

 No Bid 11.05.2022 

 02.06.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔ 

  22.06.2022 

 20.08.2022  بوجہ حکم امتناعی حکومت پنجاب بولی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 19.09.2022  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 17.10.2022 

 03.12.2022  کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔  

 No Bid 28.12.2022 

  25.01.2023 
 12.04.2023  بوجہ عدم موجودگی چیئرمین نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔ 

 No Bid 13.05.2023 

13.06.2023 

13.09.2023 

04.10.2023 

04.11.2023 

15.12.2023 
 28.12.2023 - کوئی رجسٹرڈ شخص بولی پر نہ آیا۔

15.01.2024 

 No Bid 27.03.2024 

18.04.2024 

07.05.2024 

27.06.2024 

20.07.2024 

17.08.2024 

19.11.2024 

04.12.2024 

18.12.2024 

 

 



 

 

DEPUTY DIRECTOR MINES & MINERAL 

D.G.KHAN REGION, D.G. KHAN 

 


