DISTRICT SAHIWAL
: E”RUFILE OF ORDINARY SAND PAKPATTAN ZONE-4, DISTRICT PAKPATTAN

ation of the Fone and As

The ordindry sand Pakpattan Zone-4 over an area of 25129.1 3 acres having a length of about 15 km &
width of about & km is marked on Topo Sheet Mo, 44-F/2 of Geological Survey of Pakistan. It is ocated
nedr doeor Pur village on Pakpatien-Sahiwal road about 23 km from Pakpatian city. It contains aluvial
depasits comprising of silt, clay and sand formed as a resull ol flood deposition during geological
translormation perieds. These sand deposits have cosrse grain size-and hence can be caregorized from
medium o gooed quakity that are overlain by ¢lay / soil layer of thickness varying from 3-4 feet, Sand

exgavarion 3% done-with the comsent of land owners i cultivated lends:

aloly of Mineral 1o the

Chuality of sand in the zone ranges from medium 1o codrse grained particle that-is mostly used for
Cunsliruclion purpeses.

¢} Availability of Access Roads to the Zone:
Cirdinary sand Pakpattan Zone-4 has:a directaccess from Pakpattan-Sahiwal road as this mad passes
through the zone. The working pits of the zone are located near Noar Pur town (on main ri'r_ad} which
15 reached after tavelling a distznce of about 23 km from Pakpattin on Pakpattan Sahiwal road.

d) Avecessibility to the Market and Con 1 _ i :

Uhe mainsand consumption market of myineral from this zone is Sahiwal city. Mostly sand excavated
P Ras 2one 1S usedl For donstruction purpeses.

£ AovernoeeyeE vinbed

uantity uf Mineral from the Zone during last U5 Years:

Al awémgr_; excuvation during past 03 years cannot be pssessed as no reeord inthis regard is available
with the office. Hawever, as per observations during site inspection, an average excavation of sand is
30-40 trollies per day.

fi Previows Bidding Histo

Bidding hiswory is attached a5 Annex-A

2} Future Potential for Excavation from the 2
I'uture potential for the excavation from the zone is expected to remain same with dn average variation
of = 10P%

Wi Any Unigue Faetor at Site to consider the Reserved Price:
Nl Sx




_f' || Previous Approved Reserve Price= Rs. 1,17,70.000/~
' Rs. 1,20,05.000/-
2| Lust highest Opeeative bid during previcus 06 vears= (valid 4ill
. o= A 08.01.2019)
An average b all received hids during fast 06 years
RSO200.000 = R L26,00,000 + Rs. BD,00,000 + Rs. LO7.00,000+ R5.99,01,000/-
R, L, 2005,000) 5= \ |
A VEeTELEE TECEIHY peT Two _y{:_m-a. in the periad of last 06 years _
(Ra 3 L3000 + Rs. LOZD0.000 + Rs. 1,20,05.000)3= Beiiie
5 An uverage of dbave (23, (3) and (4) Rs.1,01.74.778/-

i | Propesed Base price

Rs, 1,20,05,000/-

| 8r. | Maxinium . Calculated
M . . e
No | ajor Factors Weightage (%) Weightages assigned (%) awmount (is Rs)
| Genlagical survey,
féation ol zone and
| 2 j i
| assessment of mineral in d Ry aag 1ok
| the Al =
o | Buakite of the minerals in | e
= | b rane 4 Rs:4,80,200/-
' T | Up o 20%of base
« | Avarkatnlicy placeess ; ;
ol L the sane pries 3 s
\coossibllity 1o the _
4| markel ind consumption 3 Rs. 65,04, 250/~
| of thie mineral in the #one |
Future potential of . ’ I
3 i =
. excavation from the zone 4 B G 00230
i Any unigue factor at the
- site of the zone relevant % 0

: lor determining the
| TESEIVE PR

[n 10 km radius of this zone, following sand feases éxist with
following bids. reserve prices and consumption market.

onclitlom ol sirmnding
Fricss ke wenidn aid ms

Impsct un e reserve

price of this 2one,

Bid Money | Reserve Price Consumption
Mame of Lewse {Rs.} (R Murket
| Brick kilng in neurby
| Cird Shnd Ok Kone-2: | 150320008 1.35,00,000:- 31.:-;]'_'_“ E;,’-;ffg ;ﬁL
25041 ete
{rd.Sand, Sahiwal i i
vl 30,0000 | 1,55,00,000¢ Satiwal eity
O Sand Satiiwal vowih
T~ : i . ifwaln and
3 12256000 110, 00,000 nedrby chak such as
.2'“‘“-; 47151, A5E el
Cirel_Sand, ik ;
P T2 B2 | 110,00 000 Pakpatian city

AN




——

Ord, Sand Sahiwal Zone-§ and zone in question have common

. consumpiion market. Average reported supply 1o Sahiwal city from these
kg twir zones 1 3540 trollies (400cHi capacity) per day. Ord. Sand Sahiwal
I Zong-1 is closer to Sahiwal city and presently sand is being supplied from
this zone. When Pakpattan Zone-4 is granted, it attracts its share of
| trollies from Sahiwal Zone-1 by virtué ofhaving same market. Therefore,
based on expected quantum of sand excavation, Reserve price of this

zone hes been proposéd proportionate to the reserve price of Sahiwal

| Lone-1.
Inlh.l ol contributing factory p_er 1.w¢1 YRS Rs, 24,001,000/
Proposed base price per iw a :.-EJ'E N Ras. |, 20,05,000-
st mracelitad ul u-.:ln[rii'r!.n-;:;ig ihu:q?:.; :-.].::aye PFICE Per 1w Years | R;. 1.4—4,{!15,999.-'- :
= : Say | Rs. 1,44,10,000/-

e Speciyl Expent Committee considered the above reserve price estimated by the field office Sahiwal -and
after thorongh deliberation, Commitee agreed to approve the reservie price of Ks. 1,44, 10,600 /- for Ordinary
Send Pakpstian Zone-d, district Pekpatian,

(MUHAMMAD
IHRECTOR GENERAL (M1
NIAD,

AR JAVAID)
& MINERALS),
ORE

IMUHAMMAD ZAFAR JAVALD) (SYED ISHTIAQ HUSSAIN)
BIREC TOR LICENSING (MINOR MINERALS), MRECTOR
PUNIA }%IJRE. RESOURCE MAPPING, DIVISION

HEASQUARTER'S OFFICE, LAHORE

(ALLAH YAR)

DEPL TY SECRETARY (TECHNICAL)

VUNES & MINERALS DEPFARTMENT,
LAHORE




District Pakpattan
Hidding History of Ord. Sand Pakpatian Zone-4 over an aréa of 2312913 Acres

It wl - 'E"'uil;f:lf.I Amount (K&} . Hemprks.,
pwekion - bldder E:
(2000 | SsPe-—= | 1,20,01,000/!- Granted on 01.11.2010-:and was cancelled on
I j 11.05.2012 due to pon-payment of 4™ installment.
2052012 | MNawab 2,00, (00 - The hid was rejected being low.
khan
| 04.06.2012 e eee Auction could not be conducted due to non-
availability of Chairman Auction Committee,
e Pakpattan,
| ¥ 06,2012 - - The zone could not be auctioned due to satay
| order of Civil Count, Pakpattan.
| 3007.2002 ] - nnn No bid.
30.08.2002 .- etsld The zone could net be auctioned due to satay
) ) order of Session Court, Pakpattan.
| (38.10.2012 = ok Do
e e 1 b s — No bid.
¥, 1332 --- are Mo bad,
12002018 Mawnb 1,26, 00,000/ - Granted on 14, ﬂl 2013 and was can-::eilad an
Khan 20082013 due to non-payment of 2 installment:
AT B No bid.
V251120031 — i No bid,
123123013 ees o No bid.
L 23012014 | Ashig Ali | 80,00,000/~ The bid was rejecied being low, ]
L 3022014 — . - Nobid.
20s0M] | == — No bid.
11062014 | Muzammal | 1,07,00,000/- | Granted on 02.07.2014 and completed it tenure
| Hussain of two years on 01.07.2016.
| 22:12,2016 | Mugammal | 1,20,05000/ Granted on 09.01.2017 and will expire on
Hussain (8.01.2019,




@ PROFILE OF NEW ORDINARY SAND

i)

b}

¢)

il

e

DISTRICT O

ZONE

Cictlogieal
| e ordinery sand Sahniwal-Hujra Shah Mugeemn Zone pver an area of 5107.66 acres having 2 ]engﬂ]-n:-.t.'
dhat 12 ki od widih af about 1.8 km is marked on Topo Sheet No. 44-F/14, 44-F/10 of Geological
Survey of Pakisan, It is located near Hujra Shah Mugeem town about 43 km from Okara ¢ity, This 2one
contuns atuvial deposits comprising ol silt, clay and sand formed as aresult of river deposition during
seolagical transfarmation in course of old River Beas that has dried up since long. These sand deposits
have coarse grain size and hence can be categorized [rom medium to good guality that are overlain by
clay /. soil Jayer of thickness varying from 3-4 feet. Sand excavation is done with the consent of land

uwners in cultivated Lands,

CQuality of Mineral in the Zone;

Cuatlty ol sand in the gone ranges from medium 1o codtse grivinied particles that is mostly used for
PRTLL i [ NT 1 |'I-l||'i"|l.:""vl:f‘:.

Availuhility of Access

Ordinasy Sand Sahniwat-Hujrs Shah Mugeem Zone is reached after travelling about 43 km from Olara

city 10 Hujra Shah Mugeein town. The working pits of the zone are located in proximity of Hojra Shah
Mhuzeem town, After ravelling about 16 km on N-5 Highway (Lahore-Multan road) from Okara towards
| ahore. Renala Khird twwn is seachied. From Renela Khard, after an additional travelling of about 29 km
on Shergath-Hujrn Shah Mugeem mad, Sahniwal-Hujea Shah Mugeem zone is reached adjacent to the
Huira Shah Mugeem wown,

wevessibility to the Market gnd Consum ption of the Mineral in thie Fone:

Fura Shah Mugeem tews nearty villages such as Kot Shoukat, Bhotana, K hu-Bhattian, Dhole including

prospective locations of sand ¢xtavition e Shams-K; Bhai-K-Mor, Sahniwal, Rangeela etc are potential
markets of sand.

Average excavated




o

An avernge excavalion during past U3 years cannot be asfessed as no record in this regard is available
i @, ithihe office. However, s per observations during sie inspections average excavation of sind is'8-10

trollies and 1530 donkey curts per day.

P Provioos Bidding History of the £one:

Hlddinie history is stached s Annex-A
. 5 h

¢y Future Potential for Execavation from the fone:

Futiiee potential for the excevation from the zone is expected 10 remain same with an avVerage variation of
= 1o

)  Any Unigee Factor at Site o ¢ asider the Reserved Price:
ML
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SUSERVE PRICE E

NOTE: New Zone. This zone has been created in substitution of old Hujra Shah Mugeem Block that is g‘anm:l
vt TO801.2007 10 09.01.2019. As na previows history of I‘EEWt}" created zong is available, therefore, bidding

histary of ald Block has been G-'EIHEId-E[Ed to estimate Reserve price of this zone.

L Previous Approved Reserve Price of (Old Hujra Shah Mugeem Block)

Rs.22,77,586/-

et ghest Operative higd. during previous (0 years

Ks. 28.32,000/-
{valid il
09.01.2019)

A avérape of all received bidy during fust 06 years

(Rs.5.32, 000+ Rs. 1 1,32,000+Rs.20, 32.000+Rs.20.50,532+Rs. 20,70, 532+
Rs.28:32,000)6

Rs. 17,74.844/-

i | Averige receipls per twa years in the period of last 06 years

L 146,810/
1| (R 1537.899 + R 20L10,332 + Rs. 28,32,000)3 et
[ b
| § | An average of above (2), (3)and (4) Re 2251218/
| 6 | Propesed base price R, 28,32,000/-
sr. i Maximum Calculated
. h1F y o
o bajor Factors Weightage (%) Weightages assigned (%) amount (in Rs)
G bagiend sursey,
wicalron o] #gre and 3 Re B4 050/
 assessment o arinerel in N
e gy
| =3¢ | Rualirg.of the-mincrals in 4 Rs, 1,13:280/-
thiemone : |
| S e | ;o '
ST Up 102086 of base '
Avadaility ol socess road -
3 o the zone price 3 B, BA.900:
Aceessibility 1o the market _
4. | bnd consumption of the 5 e 141,600/
mineral in the zone
& EEOiE PO O 5 Rs. 1,41,600/-
exeayarton from the 2one
iy LniEue SsChor gl thi
o [EHE il l!:i.: wome relevant fop 084 a
debermining thereserve
| priee s
In 10 km radius of this zone, following sand leases exist with
| following bids, reserve prices and consumption market.
st . ; ; Bid Money Reserve Price Consumplion
baatsn of surroumding .._h!f:“ of Leise (Re:) (Rs Market
hlocks! 2ones and it Chrdl Sand, Sheegark _ .| Shergarh und Renula
7 ! ; B o : AT TR L0320 b 00, D Khiad tavn
impact on the réserve price Dref, Sand Sherenth Shergirh ond Rensla
| of this-zone a2 e — Ahrd s,
| Sl (. Band Shergark Shérparh and Renals
Fone- 30.03,.2000- 44,44 000/ FRird Ang
' = ‘.f““‘j N L0000 | 2,72.60,0000 Okars city
Zaned,




-‘l‘""-,

Y ! Dripalpur town, Mian
Mrd. Sand. M 132000/ I B0, 08, D00/ Chorasta viliage,
Cstaesn Zone | ! Chisk S10, S4 e,
» The zone under question his been created over a considerable

sand bearing areas as a substitute of former block Hujra Shah Muogeem.
It is expected that it will cater demand of more villages and chaks than
previously granted Hujra Shah Mugeem block. Grant of this zone is not
likely to have any considerable impact on the other zones in its
surroundings. However, in view of expected enhanced guantum of
gxcavation from this new Zone, d weightage factor of 40% of the base
price his been added to rationalize its Reserve Price.

| Welghuge Factor 40%% Rs. 11,32, 800/~

| ol ol contributis BEers per two senr. Rs. 16,99,200/-
Proposed blise |‘4I.'it|.' jin’:r T-m: 3-L:ar_!:: | Ra 2832000/
Reserve rrrlq:i::wtu] al contributing factors +hase pn?e et WO years | Rs. 45,310,200/

= Say | Rs. 45.32.000-

-
Minerals,

Phe Special Fxpert Commiitiee considered the above reserve price estimated by the ’ri:l-:l_ office _Ephiw;i and
alter thonoaeht deliberntion, Commitiee agreed to approve the reserve price of Rs. 45,32,000/- tor  Ordinary
v Suhrtwgl-Hujeo Shah Mugeem Zone, districl Okara:

DIRECTOR GENERAL [MINE
PUNFAB, LAH

: (SYED 1SHTIAQ HUSSAIN)
BRECTOM L ICENSING (MINOR MINERALS), DIRECTOR

i RESOURCE MAPPING, DIVISION
HEASQUARTER'S OFFICE, LAHORE

(ALLAH YAHR)

DEPUTY SECRETARY (TECHNICAL)

MINES & MINERALS DEPARTMENT,
LAHORE




DISTRICT OKARA
@ Bidding History of Ord. Sand Szhnbwal-Hujra Shah Mugeem zone over an aréa of 5107.66 Acres
NOTE: This zone shall be suetioned for the 19 time in forthcoming auctions, It has been created in substitition

b previiusly granted Hujra Shah Mugeem block. Therefore, bidding history of the old block is given below:

Date of Name of Remarks.
auction bidder
13.12.2011 Faroog The bid was rejected being low.
N Anwar
26012012 Rehmat Thi bid was rejected being low.
M ~ UHah
| 25022012 St No bid. .
| B3.042012 | Rehmat The bid was rejected being fow.
L Litlah
| 14,9 5.2012 — Mo bid,
| §6.06.20132 Auction could not be conducted due to stay order
1/ of Civil Count; Okara,
90620131 e Do-— i
H.0T2012 Mo bid.
31082012 - Auction could not be conducted due to stay order
i of Civil Court, Okara.
Q2. 102012 - No bid,
26.11.2012 - No bid,
19122012 m— No bid.
10012013 | Abdullah The bid was refected being low,
{ Ly
: 06032013 | Abdullah | Granted on 04.04 2013 and cancelled due to non-
| L Tahir payment of 4™ installment on 10, 10,2014,
r 17.112014 s No body took part in the auction.
| | 22122014 | Abdullah | Granted on 10,017 2015 and 4% installment due
. Tahir on 1L.07.2016,
|05 122000 | Amjad fohal Granted on 10.01.2017 and will expire on
T - 09.01.2019. '

Wines d Miherals, $uhiwal,
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DISTRICT RA

PROFILE OF ORDINARY SAND HUJRA SHAH MUQEEM BLOCK

Geological ‘Block and Assessment of the Mineral in the

The ordinary sand Sahniwal-Hujea Shah Mugeem Block over an area of 494,31 acres having & length of
about 2 km & width-of about 1 kmis marked en Topo Sheet Na. 44-F/14 of Geological Survey of Pakistan.
It is Jocated nesr Hujra Shah Mugeem town about 46 km from Okara city, This block contains alluvial
deposits comprising of stlt, clay and sand formed as a result of river deposition during geclogical
translormation in course of old River Beas that has dried up §ince long, These sand deposits-have coarse
ariin shee el henee can be cateporized from medium to good quality that are overlain by clay { soil layer
ol thiekness varving from 3-4 feet. Sand excavation s dose with the consent of land owners in cultivated

lands!

Quality of Mineral in the Block:

Luality of sand in the block ranges from medium to coarse grained particles that is mostly used for

COMSIFUCTION PUrpasEs.

Avuilability of Access Roads to the Block:
Urdinary Sand Hujre Shah Mogeem Block s reached after travelling about 46 km from Okara-city 1o

Hujra Shah Mugeem own. The working pits of the block are located 3 km away from Hujea Shah Mugeem
Hw it Busides Attar rosd, After travelling about |6 km on N-3 Highway (Lahore-Multan road) from Okara
mawarids Bahore Renale Khord town is reached. From Renala Khurd, after an additional travelling of
abeut 29 km on Shergarh-Hujra Shah Mugeem road, Hujra Shah Mugeem town is reached from where

excavation pits in Hujra Shah Mugeem block can be reached after travelling 3 km on Anari road,

Hjra Shah Mugeem 1ewn, nearby villages such as Kot Shoukat, Jallu Jhugian etc-are potential markets

o sl

Mversge exedvated Quantity of Mineral from the Block during last 05 Years:

A sveripe excavation during pist 05 veurs cannot be pssessed as no record in this regard is available

ot sltiee However, as per abservitions during site inspections average excavation of sand is 8-10

LFnsilies por iy

W
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N Provigus Bidding History of the Block:

 Bidding history is attached as Annex-A

g Furture Potential {or Excavation from the Block:

it potential for tie excavation [rom the block isexpécied to rémadin same with-an averdpge variation

al-E ey,

h) Aoy Unigue Factor at Site to consider the Reserved Price:

NIL
J‘Em )
Assistant Dirécror,

Mines & Minerals, .{ISE-J-ﬁwa’I.
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I | Previous Approved Reserve Prige R5.22,77.586/
| — Rs. 28,32,000/-
Last highest Operative bid during previous 06 vears | (valid till
09.01.2019)

A .|w|'ut;u:_|;f-' !l received bids during last Df years
A Lo S A O O S T R 20, 32000+ Rs, 20,5053 24 Rs_g__ﬂ.lj!’i&g-r
Ha 22 K1

Rs. 1774844/

AVETARE receipis per iwo :.q:_ars_in the period of last ﬁﬁ:l'fﬂrﬁ
" | {Rsi15.37.899 + R 20,70,532 + Rs. 28,32,000)/3

Rs.21.46.810/

5 | Anaverage of above (2), (3} and (4)

Rs. 22,501,218

(| Proposed base price Rs. 28.32,000/-
&, Maximom - - - Caleulated
: Major Factors : Wei 8 assign i)
PN | Weightage (%) ghtag famed (%) amounl (in Rs)
Lieological survey, '
| localion of block and
guaessment af mineral in 3 Rs. 84.560)-
T fack | B
, | Wy of e minecils in ’
* | the block ; ki
- | Avdarability of gcoess road il mu’:ru It bede '
| | %0 the block i 2 R84, 0
I Accessibility to the murket
4 [ and consamption of the 5 Rs. 141,600/~
mineral in the block
Future potential of
q
' _"l:‘._'-'._l.?rdi-!..t_'l.h from the biock 3 R 141,600/
Any unique factor at the
gite of the block relevant
f i 7 i
T for deermining the reserve i -
| price =
f Im 10 km ra:t';p!-:r of this block, following sand leases exist with
| foltowing bids, reserve prices and consumplion market.
: . Bbd M Reserve '
L owation ofsurrognding . | NameolLeas |_R_-._TE? ' gﬁ.g,;}m ﬂﬂ];::-:’::im
hloeks! biocks and its Grd Sand Shergarh | gogenont | agdzo0n. | Shergachand Renula
; Block-2 Lo Khurd fowns
tmpact on the reserve price | Ord Sand Sahniival- "”:L"“ Shah Mugeem
L oo Hidlra 2kt T 3 wnd nearby villages
| a1l this hlock, s Eﬂ;:ﬂﬂqﬂt—'m oo e 535008/ sch na Jallu Jhuglan,
| . Suhniwal, Bhai-K eic
(e Sand M : : Ui S, Sty
| ek Sy ALTL00- | Ho000 Chorasta village,
i Chak 5103, 34D el

o’
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Reserve price of Ord. Sand Hujra Shah Mugeem blodk has been

proposed equivalent ta the newly created zone namely Sahniwal Hujra
g Shah Mugeem zone as both of them have common mineral consumption
market i.e Hujra Shah Mugeem Town. Therefore, a weightage of 40%
of base price has been applied 1o rationalize reserve price of this block
compared to the nearby ord, sand zone Sahniwal-Hujra Shah Mugeem.

|| Weightuge Fuctor | 0% Rs. 11,32,800/-
Votal of pontrbuting t'un..'_ll.‘.-:r!i per Twi years Rs. 16,99, 200-
Proposed base price per two years Rs, 28,327,000/
{teserve price-mal of comribuling factors +base price per two. years. Rs, 43.31,200/-

= Say | Rs. 4532000/

The Special Expen Committee considered the above reserve price estimated by the field office Sahiwal and

alter thorough deliberation, Comminee agreed (o spprove the reserve price of Rs. 45,32,000/- for Ordinary
sand Flujra Shah Mugeem Block, district Okara,

) PUNJAB, LAHORE kﬁﬂ}/g
(MUHAMMAD ZAFAR JAVALD) {STE i HUSSAIN)

DIRECTOR LICENSING IMINOR MINERALS), MRECTOR

PUNIA RE. RESOURCE MAPPING, DIVISION
HEASQUARTER'S OFFICE, LAHORE

IALLAH YAR)

BEPUEY SECRETARY (TECHN iE.ﬂ!LIA

MINES & MINERALS DEPARTMENT,
LAHORE




DISTRICT OKARA
Bidding History of Ord, Sand Hujrs Shah Mugeem block over an area of 494 3] Acres

Date of r Name of Remarks.
| auction | bidder |
13, 1232011 |  Farbog The bid was rejected being Iow.
— | htar =!
26002012 |  Rehma The bid was rejected being low,
| PO LR S—— U!]Eh
| 25.02.32012 i No bid,
03042012 | Rehmat The bid was rejected being low.
| Litlah
1'_1;1'.]155.2!] |2 p— No bid,
| 06.06.2012 seas Auction coutd not be conducted due 1o stay onder
| of Civil Court, Okara,
(19062012 = Do
| 30072012 Mo bid.
Fh02012 s Auction could not be conducted due 1o stay-arder
E of Civil Court, Okara,
| G2.10.2012 _-_ Na bid.
26112012 Nao bid.
0 o e e e Mobid
F.012013 | Abdullah The bid was rejected being low.
Tahir
(06052015 | Abdullah | Granted on 04,04.2013 and cancelled due 10 no
' | Tahir payment of 4" installment on 10.10.2014,
F7.00.2014 s No body took part in the auction,
211220104 | Abdullah | Granted on 10,01".2015 and 4* installment due
Tahir on 10:07.2016.
05.12.2016 | Amjad lgbal Granted en 10.01.2017 and will expire on

09.01.2019.
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DISTRICT SAHIWAL
PROFILE OF NEW ORDINARY SAND MULLAH HAMZA ZONE

iy :purthnznnc'a ment of t ineral in the :

The ordinary sand Mullah Hamza zone over an arca of 10950.7 acres having a length of about 8 km &
widih of about & km is marked on Topo Sheet No. 44-F/l of Geological Survey of Pakistan. This zone is
liscated adjacent to Mari Pattan Bridge on Okara-Faisalabad road about 64 km from Sahiwal city. It
comprises of hoth alluvial as well as luvial deposits of sand formed as a result of river deposition. Alluvial
depusis ure pvertaln with an over burden of 2-3 feet soil and mostly constitute agriculral lands, The
il denusits comprise ol Fiver hed of Ravi withoutany overburden which are replenished cach year

Juring Mowd seasons, Sand excavation is done with the consent of land owners in cultivaied lands.

Quality of Mineral in the Zoneé:
Ouality of sand in the zone ranges from medium to coarse grained particles that 1s usfd for mostly

Construction purposes

Acvailabili

of Ace he Zone:

COrdinary Sand Muliah Hamza Zone 15 reached after travelling about 64 km from Sahiwal to Mullah
Humea villape were working pits of this zone are located. From Sahiwal city, after travelling about 42 km
o1 St Dinng e Gogera road, Bangla Guigera town is reached. From Bangia Guger, after an additional
veahelling of whigt 12 km on Okara-Faisalabad roud, Watto Chowk is reached from where 2 link road

ahoul § km (trackable) leads 1w Mullah Hamza Zone near Muliah Hamza village.

ity to the Murket and Cons i { the Miner

¢l

§]

e TTuvial deposits contain coarse sand of pood quality that has considerable demand in néarby town f.o.
Fandlignwala, distict Fafsalabad thist is slso the nearest major censumption market, Other consumption

markets are Okara city and nearby small villages such a8 Mullah Hamia, Khail etc,

Years:

with the aitice. However, as per ahservations during site inspition, an averige excavation of sand s 10-

Cof the Zone: \
e i
/ \_E-}

M bl s petr duy




Hidding history is attached as Annex-A

‘] Fuiure Polentin cavittion f thie Zone:

f Future potential for the excavation from the zone is expecled to remain same with an average variation of
1 ||:|IJ (1]

| Iy Amy Llmigue

hi Reserved Price:

NIL

‘.“. b

B '-. \
W

)
- A&:E: Difbéick

Mines & Minerals, Sahiwal
X




’ RESERYE FRICE EST

NOTE: NOTE: Mew Zone. This zone has been'creted by merging previcusly granted Mullah l_'l_amza__h!nck
and adding-sand bearing area to it As no previous history of newly created zone is available, therefore, bidding
history of old hlock hus been considered 1o estimate Reserve price of this zone,

j || Previess Approved Reserve Price {old Mullah Hamza Block) R.22,63,616/-
= B Rs.65,32,000:-
b st hlshest Opérative bid during prévious 06 years= (Valid till
(5.00.201 )
| An average of all received bidsduring last (6 years - ]
3| (Rs.20,03,200+Ra.65,32,000)/2= Rs.42,07,600¢
- - : :
| Averape receipts per two years in the period of last 06 vears. !
4| | Re.20.03.200+Rs,65,32,000)/3= R 2LA5R0T
§ | An averge of above (2), (3) and (4) Rs.45,48.322/-
6 | Proposed base price | Ris.65,32,000
|
: — |
NE = Maximum l | Caleulated
. , Welght assigned (% T T
T i i Weightage (%) | T ceotagesassigned () |, pount in Rs) |
Creolopical survaey.
location ol 2one and 3 Re. 1.05.060/-
wssesimeal of mineral i ——
~ thegone |
| |
L=l l_i}uéti'l}' of the minerals | | 4 Rs. 261280/
in thies #ond
F e Up to 20% of base
Availability of access price 3 Rs. 1.95.960/-
| roud 1o the zone
Il Aeoessibility w the | .
4 | marke! snd consampiion 5 Ry, 326,600/
|9l thet mrineral in the zone | =
o | Puture potential ol 5 Rs. 31.76. 600/~
excavation trom the 20ne o
Loy unigiie faetos al the
i <ol the aone relevant G, i
fisr dgteriiimimg Fhe

| restrve pricc
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Location of surrcunding

Fones’ ones-and ity

In its radivs of 10 kmof this zong, fllowing sand leases exist with

following bids, reserve price and consumption market.

Fi =
impact an the reserve

| price of this #one,

. Bid Money | Reserve Price Consumption
Mame of Lease th_a-.i (Ra.) Mu_m.
| Ord Sand Sahiwal Zone- | 2,700,000 | 1460000 Sahiwalcity |
' L ; , | Vogers Rador, T
Ord; Sund Ok Zeme= 1 | BO005.000 | 1LIR50, 000~ city g nenha chaks




! inchuding
| | Tandrianwata 6
. istrivt Falsalabad
’ Gk Rand- Alam Shak Kanjwani, M
Khags Fone (Fulls ln TR0 0000 [ GRO00000 | Kanjan, Tendlianwala
| district Falsalahad) : and pearhy chaks

Ord. Sand Okara Zone-1, Ord. Sand Alam Shah Khaga Zone and
#0ne in question have different major consumption markets as mentioned
against each in above table. Market of these three zones overfaps to the |

extent of Tandlianwala town, district Faisalabad, Keeping in view the
madest demand of Tandlianwals and contribution of existing leases for
supply of sand 10 it, grant of this Zone might have no considerable impact
-on-other zones in its surroandings.

| Tiotal uh:-a:-nwi_l.‘mﬂng factors per two years. Rs. 13,006,400/
| P'roposed base price per two years Rs.65,32,0400-
. Jh*hiu-r-'- ¢ _mj-:u=1m'al af contributing fuctors +Hhase price per two years Rs. 7838400/

. . Say | Rs. 78.40,000/-

Fhe Special Fxpert Committee considered the above reserve price estimated by the field office Sahiwal and
after thorough deliberation, Committee agreed to approve the reserve price of Rs. 1,00,00,000 /- for Ordinary
Sand Mullen Hames Zone, district Sahiwal in view of reserve priges of surrounding sand zones.
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Bidding History of Mullah Hamza zone over an area of 10950.7 Acres

Note: This zone hus been revised over previously granted Mullah Hamya Block. This zone will be auctioned

P time in the E't;lrthl:ummg auction schedule, Therefore, to estimate its Reserve Price, bidding history of
Mulllah Hamza block is given below.

Date of Amount ;
ﬂ'll'l’..‘ﬁ:l'..'lln {E&.} Rt'mirks._

| ' Granted on 05.11,2014:and

E 1102014 | 20,03,200/ | completed its tenure of two years
on 04.11,2016.

Granted on 03.01.2017 and will

expire on @2.01.2019.

201120046 | 6532,000-




