
 

Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 
 
 

ORDINARY SAND QILA RAJA SINGH  DISTRICT NAROWAL 

 
 

a)  Geological Survey, Location  and Assessment of Mineral in the Zone:   

The lease for excavation of sand for this zone over an area of 490.81 acres is located near Qila Raja Singh District Narowal falls on Topo sheet No.No.43-L/11, 43-L/12 & 43-L/15 survey of Pakistan. This sand 

zone is located Qiala Raja Singh District Narowal.     

b) Quality of Mineral in the Zone: 

Medium quality of sand deposits with light brown colour are present in the zone area. 

c) Availability of Access Road to the Zone: 

First main access to the area of zone is present main Narowal road District Narowal..  

d) Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral from the Zone:  

Main consumption market of sand of this area is for filling as well as construction purpose in the Pasror City & adjoining villages near this zone.  

e)  Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Zone During Last 5 years: 

f) An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 20-30 Dumpers and 50-70 trollies per day except rainy season.  

g) Previous Bidding History of the Zone:  

Attached. 

h)  Future Potential for Excavation from the Zone:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of + 100%.   

i) Any Unique Factor at the Site of Zone Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil. 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

• The block is granted against a bid of Rs.3,91,00,000/- w.e.f.23.01.2023 to 22.01.2025.Consumption market of the said block is Narowal city and adjoining areas.One zone adjacent to the said mining lease 

namely Kotli Hassan Shah/Shah Pur Zone is granted against a bid of Rs.4,01,50,000/- for two years w.e.f 12.08.2024 to 11.08.2026.The reserve price of this block is higher than the other nearby granted zone. 

• The reserve price is being enhanced 10% of the last operative bid  and is proposed Rs.4,30,10,000/- of ord.sand block QilaRaja Singh District Narowal. 
 

 

 

 

 



نارووالادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ                             واقع قلعہ راجہ سنگھبرقبہ  490.81  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل      و   ضلع نارووال برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 

اتھارٹی سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ    بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/   4,30,10,000 روپے

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

پٹہ      روپے بولی منظور ہوئی3760000/-  17.07.2014
تا   03.10.2014    ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر  کا 

 ہوئی۔    دو سال معیاد پوری  جاری کیا گیا۔   02.10.2016
پٹہ     روپے بولی منظور ہوئی 20600000/-  28.11.2016

تا     15.12.2016  ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر  کا 
  جناب لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے ۔   جاری کیا گیا   14.12.2018

 روقبہ کی معیاد میں ایک ماہ کی  توسیع دی۔   228زیر  قاعدہ
روپے بولی منظور ہوئی  35100000 / -  29.12.2018

تا       29.03.2019     ورخہم  از  ورک آرڈر  
جناب   دوئم   عدم دائیگی قسط   جاری کیا گیا۔ 28.03.2021

پٹہ    کو    17.10.2019مورخہ  لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے
 منسوخ کر دیا ۔
05.03.2020              No Bid         
26.03.2022                     No Bid 
رجسٹرڈ افراد کے نہ آنے کی وجہ سے    14.04.2020

 نیلامی نہ ہو سکی۔ 

    روپے بولی منظور ہوئی35300000/-     28.05.2020
تا   23.06.2020  ورخہم   از  ورک آرڈر پٹہ کا  

  جاری کیا گیا۔   22.06.2022
10.05.2022                          No Bid 

01.06.2022                          No Bid 
21.06.2022      No Bid                            

 

نارووالادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  



 نیلام عام  مورخہ                          واقع  قلعہ راجہ سنگھبرقبہ  490.81  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل                و  ضلع نارووال برائےعرصہ دو سال 
 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 

نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          
                                                                                          

موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/ 4,30,10,000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

18.08.2022      No Bid                        

17.09.2022                      .No Bid 

2022  15.10                       No Bid 
روپے بولی آئی۔   39010000/ -کو مبلغ 01.12.2022

جناب  لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے بولی کی بابت اپنا فیصلہ التوا  
 میں رکھا ہے۔  

    روپے بولی منظور ہوئی39200000/-     27.12.2022
تا   23.01.2023  ورخہم   از  ورک آرڈر پٹہ کا  

  جاری کیا گیا۔   22.01.2025
2024  18.11                       No Bid 

No Bid                     04.12.2024 

18.12.2024                      No Bid 

    

 
 

 

 

 

 



 

Profile of Mining Concession for Estimation of Reserved Price under Rule-197(A) 

of the Punjab Mining Concession Rules, 2002 
 
 

ORDINARY SAND NOOR KOT ZONE DISTRICT NAROWAL 

 
 

j)  Geological Survey, Location  and Assessment of Mineral in the Zone:   

The lease for excavation of sand for this zone over an area of 20.12.87 acres is located near Noor Kot Zone District Narowal falls on Topo sheet No.No.43-L/11, 43-L/12 & 43-L/15 survey of Pakistan. This 

sand zone is located Noor Kot Zone District Narowal.     

k) Quality of Mineral in the Zone: 

Medium quality of sand deposits with light brown colour are present in the zone area. 

l) Availability of Access Road to the Zone: 

First main access to the area of zone is present main Narowal road District Narowal..  

m) Accessibility to the Market and Consumption of the Mineral from the Zone:  

Main consumption market of sand of this area is for filling as well as construction purpose in the Pasror City & adjoining villages near this zone.  

n)  Average Excavated Quantity of Mineral from the Zone During Last 5 years: 

o) An average excavation during past five years cannot be assessed accurately as no record is available. However, as per observations recorded during site inspections, an average excavation of Sand/Bhassar from 

the Khatala kot Fattu zone is about 20-30 Dumpers and 50-70 trollies per day except rainy season.  

p) Previous Bidding History of the Zone:  

Attached. 

q)  Future Potential for Excavation from the Zone:  

Future potential for excavation of sand is expected to remain same with variation of + 100%.   

r) Any Unique Factor at the Site of Zone Relevant for Determining Reserved Price: 

Nil. 

• Effect of Surrounding Blocks/Zones of Same Minerals: 

              The block is granted against a bid of Rs.3,10,50,000/- w.e.f. 02.12.2021 to 01.12.2023. Consumption market of the said zone is Shahkargarh, Noor Kot and nearby by villages. Two blocks/zone adjacent to the 

said mining lease namely Shahkargarh Nala Bein  is granted  against bid money Rs.1,52,20,000/-27.09.2022 to 26.09.2024 while  Ord. Sand block Khana Chatrana is vacant  with reserve price Rs.65,00,000/-. Reserve 

Price of said zone has been calculated by increasing 5% of its last operative bid and also keeping in view the  potential of area and share of this zone to the nearby consumption market. The reserve price of 

Rs.3,26,00,000/- is proposed 
 

 

 

 



 

نارووالادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام  
 نیلام عام  مورخہ                         واقع نور کوٹ زون برقبہ  2012.87  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل  شکر گڑھ و  ضلع نارووال برائےعرصہ دو سال 

 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 
نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          

                                                                                          
موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  3,26,00000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

پٹہ     روپے بولی منظور ہوئی5303200/-   04.04.2015
تا    30.04.2015    ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر کا 

 ہوئی۔  دو سال معیاد پوری   جاری کیا گیا۔   29.04.2017
پٹہ     روپے بولی منظور ہوئی6757000/-   18.03.2017

تا      30.04.2017   ورخہم  از ورک آرڈر کا 
۔ جناب لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے   جاری کیا گیا   29.04.2019

تک  پٹہ کی معیاد میں   29.9.2019مورخہ   228زیر قاعدہ 
 توسیع دی۔ 

روپے بولی منظور ہوئی 25032000 /-   16.09.2019
تا       11.10.2019   ورخہم از   ورک آرڈر 

 ہوئی۔   دو سال معیاد پوری    جاری کیا گیا۔  10.10.2021
29.09.2021                 No Bid         

  مسترد   روپے بولی -/2,77,00,000     23.10.2021
 ہو ئی ۔ 

روپے بولی منظور ہوئی 31050000 /-   13.11.2021
    01.12.2023تا  02.12.2021    ورخہم   ورک آرڈر 

 جاری کیا گیا۔  کو
12.09.2023                 No Bid         

02.10.2023                         No Bid 
01.11.2023                        No Bid 

13.12.2023                        No Bid 

26.12.2023                        No Bid 

18.01.2024                        No Bid 

27.03.2024                         No Bid 

   

نارووالادنیٰ معدنیات ضلع  عام  پرت نیلام   



 نیلام عام  مورخہ                         واقع نور کوٹ زون برقبہ  2012.87  ایکڑز عام ریت / گسر  تحصیل  شکر گڑھ و  ضلع نارووال برائےعرصہ دو سال 
 بلاک نیلام سابقہ کیفیت  تفصیل موجودہ بولی  سفارشات و فیصلہ لائسنسنگ  اتھارٹی 

نام بولی دہندہ                                                                          
                                                                                          

موجودہ بولی                                 

زرنیلام                                        تاریخ نیلام         
 کیفیت 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 ریزروقیمت مبلغ   -/  3,26,00000روپے 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ائٓی ۔ جناب   روپے بولی 3262000/-   18.04.2024
ی کی بابت اپنا  منظور لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے بولی کی 

 فیصلہ التو ا میں رکھا ہوا ہے۔
ائٓی ۔ جناب   روپے بولی 3285000/-  07.05.2024 

فر ما لی ۔ کامیاب بولی  منظورلائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے بولی  
دہندہ کو آفر لیٹر جاری کر دیا گیا۔ لیکن کامیاب بولی دہندہ کی 

طرف سے نیلام عام کے وقت جمع کروایا گیا زر چہارم کا 
جعلی  ثابت ہونے  پر    پے آرڈر بنک کی طرف سے  

محکمہ کی طرف سے اس کے خلاف متعلقہ تھانہ میں ایف  
آئی آر درج کرو ا دی گئی اور  جناب لائسنسنگ اتھارٹی نے  

 زون ہذا کو دوبارہ نیلام کرنے کا حُکم فرمایا۔ 
کوئی بھی رجسٹرڈ شخص نیلام میں حصہ      27.06.2024

 لینے نہ آیا لہذا نیلامی نہ ہوئی۔
22.07.2024            No Bid 
کوئی بھی رجسٹرڈ شخص نیلامی            17.08.2024

 میں حصہ لینے نہ آیا۔ اس لیے نیلامی  نہ ہو سکی۔  
2024  18.11         No Bid 

No Bid         04.12.2024 

18.12.2024        No Bid 

 


